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Shifting International Investment Law  
Toward Sustainable Development:  

Strategies for renegotiation, reform and defence 
 

AGENDA 
 

DAY 1 WEDNESDAY, FEBRUARY 27, 2019 

9:00 Registration 

9:30 Opening Ceremony and Welcoming Remarks 

Speakers: 

• H.E. Mr. José Manuel Restrepo, Minister, Ministry of Industry, Trade and Tourism, 
Colombia 

• H.E. Mr. Camilo Gómez Alzate, Director, National Agency for the Legal Defence of the 
State (ANDJE), Colombia 

• Ms. Nathalie Bernasconi, Group Director, Economic Law and Policy, International 
Institute for Sustainable Development (IISD)  

• Mr. Carlos Correa, Executive Director, South Centre 

10:00 Session 1: Recent developments concerning international investment law and 
policy-making 

This session will set out some of the most recent developments concerning international 
investment policy-making, reform and dispute settlement. This annual update on recent 
developments will provide an overview of the following topics, to be discussed in further 
detail in later sessions of the Forum: 

• Progressive national and regional models, treaties and approaches around the world 

• Trends in termination and renegotiation 

• The backlash against investor–state arbitration continues: USMCA, Achmea and more 

• EU, UNCITRAL and ICSID discussions on ISDS reform 

• Regional initiatives: AfCFTA, RCEP, among others 

• Processes outside the realm of investment law: UN legally binding instrument on 
business and human rights and other initiatives on business and human rights. 

Moderator: Ms. Yewande Sadiku, Executive Secretary/CEO, Nigerian Investment 
Promotion Commission (NIPC), Nigeria 
Panelists:  

• Mr. Marcelo Salazar, Director of Foreign Trade, Ministry of Industry, Trade and SMEs, 
Dominican Republic 

• Mr. Prudence Sebahizi, Chief Technical Advisor & Head of CFTA Unit, Department of 
Trade and Industry, African Union Commission 

• Ms. Samira Sulejmanovic, Head of Department for Bilateral Trade Relations, Ministry of 
Foreign Trade and Economic Relations, Bosnia and Herzegovina 

• Ms. Elisabeth Tuerk, Chief, International Investment Agreements Section, Division on 
Investment and Enterprise, United Nations Conference on Trade and Development 
(UNCTAD) 
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• Mr. Daniel Uribe Terán, Visiting Researcher, South Centre 

11:30 Break 

12:00 Break-out Session 1: Sharing experiences on countries’ priorities and objectives for 
reform 

What are countries’ views on reform of international investment law and dispute 
settlement? Are countries engaging in the UNCITRAL, ICSID and other processes and 
what are their objectives? What challenges are countries facing as a result of the 
proliferation of fora addressing reform of investment law and dispute settlement? How are 
countries approaching new negotiations, renegotiation and termination?  

[A survey has been circulated to participants in advance of the Forum to help them prepare 
for this session. Main points will be captured in writing and shared electronically, feeding 
into later sessions.] 

13:00 Lunch 

14:00 Session 2: Understanding ongoing multilateral and regional processes in investment 
treaty law and policy  

In this session, participants will discuss the problems countries are trying to fix through 
ongoing processes. What are the problems they are facing as respondents? What would 
countries’ preferred outcomes be? What can be achieved through tweaking and what 
through more systemic change? What impacts do developments in the context of business 
and human rights have on investment law making and dispute settlement, including with 
respect to corruption and investor behaviour more generally? This session will take a deep 
dive into ongoing processes and developments: 

• UNCITRAL 

• ICSID 

• Regional negotiations (RCEP, AfCFTA, among others) 

• Responsible investment, including business and human rights, and corruption issues 

Moderator: Ms. Roslyn Ng’eno, Manager, Policy Advocacy, Kenya Investment Authority, 
Kenya 

Panelists:  

• Mr. Martin Dietrich Brauch, International Law Adviser, IISD 

• Mr. Carlos Correa, South Centre 

• Mr. Wamkele Mene, Chief Director, Africa Multilateral Economic Relations, International 
Trade & Economic Development Division, Department of Trade & Industry, South Africa 

• Ms. Ana María Ordoñez Puentes, Director of International Legal Defence, ANDJE, 
Colombia 

15:30 Break 

16:00 Session 3: Leveraging developments in investment treaty law and policy to achieve 
developing country objectives and improve defence strategies 

This session will take a closer look at critical developments in recent negotiations and 
arbitrations in order to identify new opportunities to leverage ongoing processes and 
developments to achieve developing country objectives. It will look at how the ongoing 
developments relate to objectives and priorities set by developing country governments. 
Discussions will include developments around: 

• USMCA (the new NAFTA) 



 

                                                        

 

 

 

3 
 

 

 

 

• EU proposals on the creation of a multilateral investment court (MIC) and the Achmea 
decision of the European Court of Justice; CJEU decision on the compatibility of the 
Investment Court System in CETA with EU law 

• Review of the Energy Charter Treaty (ECT) and adoption of the Model Instrument on 
Management of Investment Disputes developed by the Energy Charter Secretariat 

How can developing countries leverage these developments to support their own goals and 
maximize impacts in negotiations and defence? 

Moderator: Ms. Patience Okala, Deputy Director/Legal Adviser, Nigerian Investment 
Promotion Commission, Nigeria [TBC] 
Panelists:  

• Ms. Opeyemi Temitope Abebe, Adviser Trade Competitiveness, Trade, Oceans and 
Natural Resources Directorate, Commonwealth Secretariat  

• Ms. María Paula Arenas Quijano, ANDJE, Colombia 

• Mr. Makane Moïse Mbengue, Professor of International Law, Faculty of Law, University 
of Geneva  

• Mr. Nicolás Palau van Hissenhoven, Director of Foreign Investment, Services and 
Intellectual Property, Ministry of Trade, Industry and Tourism, Colombia 

• Mr. Vaibhav Rundwal, Deputy Director, Investment Division, Department of Economic 
Affairs, Ministry of Finance, India 

18:00 End of Plenary  

19:30–
21:00 

Welcome Reception – all participants are invited 

 

 

DAY 2 THURSDAY, FEBRUARY 28, 2019 

9:00 Session 4: Recent developments in treaty-based investment arbitration and 
negotiations and their impact on reform: a practitioner’s perspective  

In this session, based on a presentation by an investment arbitration practitioner, 
participants will discuss their experience with developments in investment arbitration and 
negotiations and analyze how such developments have impacted international 
negotiations, processes and debates, including at UNCITRAL and ICSID. How can 
countries achieve better outcomes in their negotiations based on their arbitration 
experience? How can and should developments in jurisprudence be leveraged for the 
development of standards? How can the experience of countries on corruption and investor 
behaviour more generally be translated into treaty practice?   

Moderator: Mr. Mauricio González Cuervo, Director, Center of Arbitration and Conciliation, 
Chamber of Commerce of Bogotá, Colombia 
Speaker: Mr. George Kahale III, Partner, Curtis, Mallet-Prevost, Colt & Mosle LLP 

Commentators: 

• Ms. Blanca Gómez de la Torre, Pactum Dispute Resolution Consulting, Ecuador 

• Ms. Soaad Hossam, Counsellor, Ministry of Justice, Egypt 

• Mr. Trung Pham, Acting Deputy Head, Division of Legal and Economics, Department of 
International Law and Treaties, Ministry of Foreign Affair, Vietnam 

11:00 Break 
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11:30 Session 5: Engaging bilaterally and multilaterally on renegotiation and termination: 
sharing experiences 

How do the discussions in the previous sessions of the Forum relate to developing 
countries’ strategy at the bilateral level? What steps are countries taking with respect to the 
stock of old-style treaties? How can developing countries use developments in their 
investment negotiations, terminations and renegotiations? Have countries been considering 
exhaustion of local remedies and unilateral declarations withdrawing the implicit or explicit 
offer in BITs to accept the jurisdiction of an arbitration tribunal as options? Are there 
multilateral solutions for termination, re-negotiation and withdrawal of consent? 

Moderator: Ms. Kekeletso Mashigo, Director, Multilateral Organizations, South Africa 
Panelists:  

• Mr. Sebastian Espinosa Velasco, International Public Law Adviser, Legal Secretariat, 
Presidency of the Republic, Ecuador 

• Mr. Rahmat Kurniawan, Legal Advisor, Directorate of Legal Affairs and International 
Treaties, Ministry of Foreign Affairs, Indonesia 

• Ms. Suzy Nikièma, International Law Adviser, IISD 

• Mr. Félix Zongo, Director of Industry, Ministry of Trade, Industry and Handcraft, Burkina 
Faso 

13:00 Lunch 

14:00 Break-out Session 2: Designing strategies to deal with outdated treaties 
What options do countries have to deal with their stock of outdated treaties? What steps 
can be taken? How can countries best prepare and organize themselves? [A survey has 
been circulated to participants in advance of the Forum to help them prepare for this 
session. The outcomes will be presented to the plenary by designated leaders.] 

15:30 Break 

16:00 Session 6: Relationship between issues of process and issues of substance  

This session will allow participants to debate how ongoing processes and developments—
including at UNCITRAL and ICSID and regional negotiations—can help orient outcomes 
towards objectives and priorities set by developing country governments. It will take a 
closer look at how procedural outcomes could affect substantive issues in international 
economic governance. How can undesired consequences be anticipated and avoided? 
How can procedural outcomes advance the progressive development of international 
investment law and policy? It will also consider how changes in substantive law being 
considered today can be factored into the procedural discussions that are ongoing. Issues 
that will be addressed by speakers include:  

• The procedural and substantive aspects of the discussion on counterclaims within the 
process of reforming ISDS; and 

• Investor obligations and the procedural discussion pertaining to access of investors to 
ISDS. 

Moderator: Mr. Carlos Correa, South Centre 
Panelists:  

• Ms. Silvina González Napolitano, Investment Agreements, Ministry of Foreign Affairs and 
Worship, Argentina 

• Mr. Howard Mann, Senior International Law Adviser, IISD 

• Mr. Makane Mbengue, University of Geneva  

• Ms. Yasmin Sultana, Joint Secretary, Ministry of Industries, Bangladesh 
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18:00 End of Plenary  

 

DAY 3 FRIDAY, MARCH 1, 2019 

9:00 Session 7: Engaging multilaterally to redesign investment-related dispute settlement  

This session will focus on ongoing multilateral processes to reform investment related 
dispute settlement. It will take an in-depth look at different potential models and outcomes 
in UNCITRAL Working Group III. This session will also include a discussion on non-
traditional dispute settlement approaches. How can dispute settlement mechanisms be 
designed to address investment-related issues more comprehensively? How can 
stakeholders, other than investors and states, be included? How can investors be held 
accountable? Topics will include: 

• More permanent investment related dispute settlement structures, including the role of 
domestic courts 

• Dispute prevention and accountability mechanisms 

• Alternative dispute resolution (conciliation, mediation) 

• State–state dispute settlement 

• Investor as a respondent 

• Procedural improvements in investor–state arbitration (costs, third-party funding, 
corruption, etc.) 

• Termination of treaties and withdrawal of consent to ISDS 

Moderator: Ms. Chantal Ononaiwu, Trade Policy & Legal Specialist, Office of Trade 
Negotiations, CARICOM Secretariat 
Panelists: 

• Ms. Nathalie Bernasconi, IISD  

• Ms. Kekeletso Mashigo, South Africa 

• Mr. Pedro Paranhos, Diplomat, Ministry of Foreign Affairs, Brazil 

11:00 Break 

11:30 Break-out Session 3: Designing optimal outcomes in the UNCITRAL process for 
developing countries  

What are optimal outcomes at UNCITRAL? Building from the previous session, groups will 
discuss the potential design and elements of dispute settlement in more detail.  

[The break-out groups will rotate to address various questions, building on the survey 
circulated to participants in advance of the Forum. The outcomes will be presented to the 
plenary by designated leaders.] 

13:00 Lunch 

14:00 Open Discussion: Building groups and coalitions and strategies to advance 
developing country priorities in international and regional processes. 

Moderator: Ms. Opeyemi Abebe, Commonwealth Secretariat 

15:30 Closing Ceremony 

16:00 End of Plenary and Closing Reception 

 

DAY 4 SATURDAY, MARCH 2, 2019 

8–13:00 Networking and Cultural Activity 
 


